o IRVINE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT

5050 Barranca Parkway, Irvine, California 92604-4652 « 949/936-5000 « FAX 949/936-5259 » www.iustl.org

June 30, 2022

Mr. Preston Evans

Office & Ergonomic Solutions, Inc.
8480 Utica Avenue

Rancho Cucamonga, CA 91730

Re: Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment
Dear Mr. Preston Evans,

| am pleased to inform you that on June 28, 2022, the Irvine Unified School District’s Board of Education
approved a partial award of the project referenced above to your company. Attached, is a Bid Matrix, items
awarded to your company are highlighted in yellow under your company name.

In accordance with the contract, please return the documents listed below within five {5) business days of
receipt of this notice:

Agreement — please sign in blue ink whenever possible

Tobacco Use Policy

Worker’s Compensation Certificate

Drug-Free Workplace Certification

Criminal Records Check Certification

Certificates of Insurance (including an Additional tnsured Endorsement)

Sk W R

No work in connection with this project shall commence before submitting the documents referenced above.
The initial contract will be in full force and effect from July 1, 2022 through June 30, 2023. Pursuant to
Education Code 17596, and by mutual written agreement and approval of the District’s Governing Board the
contract may be extended for two (2) additional one (1) year terms, for a maximum term of three (3) years.
Renewal will be under the same terms and conditions as set forth in the initial contract period.

On behalf of the Irvine Unified School District, | congratulate you on the success of your proposal and look
forward to a mutually rewarding relationship. Please call me at the number listed below if you have any
questions.

Sincerely,

Maria Ragas

Specialist, Purchasing Contracts
P:949-936-5212

Enc.

BOARD OF EDUCATION
PAUL BOKOTA ¢ [LAURCN BROOKS / IRAGLASKY / SHARON WALLIN / CYRILYU
TERRY L. WALKER, Superintendent of Schuols
JOI'IN FOGARTY, Assistant Superintendent, Business Services / BRIANNE FORD, Assisiant Superintendent, Information Technology
CAMONN O'DONOVAN, Assistani Superintendent, Human Resources ¢ CTASSIE PARFIAM, Assistant Superintendent, Education Services

IUSD ... providing the highest quality educational experience we can envision.
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AGREEMENT

THIS AGREEMENT, dated the 29 day of June 2022, in the County of Orange, State of
California, is by and between Irvine Unified School District (hereinafter referred to as
“DISTRICT”, and Office & Ergonomic Solutions, Inc. (hereinafier referred to as
“CONTRACTOR?).

The DISTRICT and the CONTRACTOR, for the consideration stated herein, agree as
follows:

1. CONTRACTOR agrees to comply with all the terms and conditions set forth in the
proposal documents for Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment, including but not
limited to the Notice Calling for Bids, Calendar of Events, Information for Bidders, Bid Form, Bid
Form Pricing Sheet, References, Noncollusion Declaration, Certification of Primary Participant
Regarding Debarment, Suspension, and Other Responsibility Matters, Certification of Restrictions
on Lobbying, Agreement, Tobacco Use Policy, Worker’s Compensation Certificate, Drug-Free
Workplace Certification, Criminal Records Check Certification, W-9, Insurance Certificates and
Endorsements, General Conditions, and all modifications, addenda and amendments thereto by
this reference incorporated herein. The bid documents are complementary, and what is called for
by any one shall be as binding as if called for by all.

2. CONTRACTOR shall timely perform everything required to be performed, and
shall provide, furnish and pay for all the labor, materials, supplies, tools, equipment, and all
applicable taxes, utility and transportation services required pursuant to this Agreement. All of
said work shall be performed and completed in 2 good workmanlike manner in strict accordance
with all provisions of this Agreement as hereinabove defined and in accordance with applicable
laws, codes, regulations, ordinances and any other legal requirements. The CONTRACTOR shall
be liable to the DISTRICT for any damages arising as a result of a faiture to fully comply with this
obligation.

3. DISTRICT shall pay to the CONTRACTOR, as full consideration for the faithful
performance of this Agreement, subject to any additions or deductions as agreed to in writing,
according to the unit prices identified on the Bid Form Pricing Sheet.

4, The initial term of the Agreement is in full force and effect from July 1, 2022
through June 30, 2023. The term of the Agreement may be extended upon mutual consent of
District and successful bidder(s) for an additional two (2) one (1) year periods in accordance with
provisions contained in the Education Code section 17596 (K-12). The maximum term of the
Agreement is three (3) years.

5. Time is of the essence.

6. The DISTRICT shall have discretion to terminate this Agreement at any time and
require CONTRACTOR to cease all work under this Agreement by providing CONTRACTOR
thirty (30) days prior written notice of termination, CONTRACTOR shall;

i) Cease operations as directed by DISTRICT in the notice;

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment o  1|Page
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7(/ IRVINE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT

(i)  Take any actions necessary, or that DISTRICT may direct, for the protection
and preservation of the work; and
(iii)  Not terminate any insurance provisions required by the proposal documents.

In case of such termination for the DISTRICT’s convenience, CONTRACTOR shall be entitled to
receive payment from the DISTRICT for furniture and equipment satisfactorily received and
accepted prior to the effective date of the termination. The foregoing provisions are in addition to
and not in limitation of any other rights or remedies available to the DISTRICT.

7. The CONTRACTOR agrees to and does hereby indemnify and hold harmless the
DISTRICT, its Governing Board, officers, agents, and employees from every claim or demand
made, and every liability, loss, damage, or expense, of any nature whatsoever, which may be
incurred by reason of:

(a) Any injury to or death of any person(s) or damage to, loss or theft of any
property sustained by the CONTRACTOR or any person, firm or corporation employed by
the CONTRACTOR, either directly or by independent contract, upon or in connection with
the work called for in this AGREEMENT, except for liability resulting from the sole active
negligence, or willful misconduct of the DISTRICT.

(b) Any injury to or death of any person(s), or damage, loss or theft of any
property caused by any act, neglect, default or omission of the CONTRACTOR, or any
person, firm, or corporation employed by the CONTRACTOR, either directly or by
independent contract, arising out of, or in any way connected with the work covered by
this Agreement, whether said injury or damage occurs either on or off DISTRICT property,
if the liability arose due to the negligence or willful misconduct of anyone employed by
the CONTRACTOR, either directly or by independent contract.

The CONTRACTOR, at CONTRACTOR’s own expense, cost, and risk shall defend any and all
actions, suits, or other proceedings that may be brought or instituted against the DISTRICT, its
Govermning Board, officers, agents or employees, on any such claim, demand or liability, and shall
pay or satisfy any judgment that may be rendered against the DISTRICT, its Governing Board,
officers, agents or employees in any action, suit or other proceedings as a result thereof.

8. All items shall be subject to the inspection of the DISTRICT. Inspection of the
items shall not relieve the CONTRACTOR from any obligation to fulfill this Agreement.
Defective items shall be made good by the CONTRACTOR, and unsuitable items may be rejected,
notwithstanding that such defective items have been previously overlooked by the DISTRICT and
accepted. If any items shall be found defective at any time before final acceptance of the complete
delivery, the CONTRACTOR shall forthwith remedy such defect in a manner satisfactory to the
DISTRICT. All items rejected by the DISTRICT at any time prior to final inspection and
acceptance shall at once be removed from the place of delivery by the CONTRACTOR who shall
assume and pay the cost thereof without expense to the DISTRICT, and shall be replaced by items
satisfactory to the DISTRICT.

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Fumiture & Equipment ' ' 2(Page
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9. While engaged in carrying out and complying with the terms and conditions of this
Agreement the CONTRACTOR is an independent contractor, and is not an officer, employee or
agent of the DISTRICT.

10.  CONTRACTOR shall, at CONTRACTOR s sole cost and expense, provide for and
maintain in full force and effect, from the commencement of services until the expiration of this
Agreement, a policy or policies of insurance, in connection with the furnishing of materials,
articles, or services covered under this Agreement. CONTRACTOR agrees to provide an
endorsement to this policy(s) stating, “Such insurance as is afforded by this policy shall be primary,
and any insurance carried by the DISTRICT shall be excess and noncontributory.” In addition,
CONTRACTOR agrees to name DISTRICT, its Governing Board, officers, agents and employees
as additional insured under said policy. No later than five (5) calendar days after the execution of
this Agreement, CONTRACTOR shall provide DISTRICT with copies of the policy or policies of
insurance evidencing all coverage’s and endorsements required hereunder including a provision
for a thirty (30) day written notice of cancellation or reduction in coverage.

a. CONTRACTOR shall, at CONTRACTOR’s sole cost and expense,
maintain in full force and effect the following insurance coverages from a California
liccnsed insurer with an A, VIII, or better rating from A.M. Best or an approved self-
insurance program, sufficient to cover any claims, damages, liabilities, costs and expenses
(including attorney fees) arising out of or in connection with CONTRACTOR’s fulfillment
of the obligations under this AGREEMENT:

i, Comprehensive General Liability Insurance, including bodily
injury, property damage and contractual liability with minimum limits set by the
DISTRICT. The policy may not contain an exclusion for sexual molestation or
abuse coverage, may be waived by the DISTRICT.

(1) General Aggregate $2,000,000
(2) Each Occurrence $1,000,000
(3) Products/Completed Operations $1,000,000
(4) Personal and Advertising Injury : $1,000,000
(5) Damage to Rented Premises $50,000
(6) Medical Expense (any one person) $5,000
1. Umbrella (excess) liability insurance coverage with a limit of

$3,000,000, unless waived by the DISTRICT. The policy may not contain an
exclusion for sexual molestation or abuse coverage, may be waived by the
DISTRICT.

jil. Business Automobile Liability Insurance for owned, scheduled,
non-owned, or hired automobiles with a combined single limit not less than
$1,000,000 per occurrence. (Required only if the CONTRACTOR drives on behalf
of the DISTRICT in the course of performing Services.)

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment o - 3|Page
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iv. Professional Liability Insurance with a limit of $1,000,000 per
occurrence, unless waived by the DISTRICT.

v. Workers’ Compensation and Employers Liability Insurance in a
form and amount covering CONTRACTOR’s full liability under the California
Workers’ Compensation Insurance and Safety Act and in accordance with
applicable state and federal laws. The policy shall be endorsed with the insurer’s
waiver of rights of subrogation against the DISTRICT.

It should be expressly understood, however, that the coverage and limits
referred to under i., ii., iii., and iv. above shall not in any way limit the liability of
the CONTRACTOR.

b. No later than ten (10) days from execution of this AGREEMENT by the
DISTRICT and CONTRACTOR, and prior to commencing the Services under this
AGREEMENT, CONTRACTOR shall provide DISTRICT with certificates of insurance
evidencing all coverages and endorsements required hereunder.

CONTRACTOR shall provide prior written notice to the DISTRICT thirty
(30) days in advance of any non-renewal, cancellation, or modification of the required
insurance. The certificates of insurance providing the coverages referred to in clauses (i)
and (ii) above shall name DISTRICT, its Governing Board, officers, and employees, as
additional insureds with appropriate endorsements. In addition, the certificates of
insurance shall include a provision stating “Such insurance as is afforded by this policy
shall be primary, and any insurance carried by DISTRICT shall be excess and
noncontributory.” Failure to maintain the above mentioned insurance coverages shall be
cause for termination of this AGREEMENT

Insurance Covering Special Hazards: The following special hazards shall
be covered by rider or riders to above-mentioned public liability insurance or property
damage insurance policy or policies of insurance, or by special policies of insurance in
amounts as follows:

Automotive and truck where operated in amounts as above.
Material hoist where used in amounts as above.

11 If CONTRACTOR is a corporation, the undersigned hereby represents and
_ warrants that the corporation is duly incorporated and in good standing in the State of
Ca[ l&cﬂjﬂl , and that ﬂ'g,g-frjb conS , whose title is <) cJE\Q'(‘i}“ ,is

authorized to act for and bind the corporation.

12. The failure of the DISTRICT in any one or more instances to insist upon strict
performance of any of the terms of this Agreement or to exercise any option herein conferred shall
not be construed as a waiver or relinquishment to any extent of the right to assert or rely upon any
such terms or option in the future.

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment 4|Pupv
Agreement



7?(’ IRVINE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT

13. The CONTRACTOR shall not assign, transfer, convey, sublet or otherwise dispose
of this Agreement or of its rights, title or interest in or to the same or any part thereof. If the
CONTRACTOR shall assign, transfer, convey, sublet or otherwise dispose of the Agreement or
its right, title or interest therein, or any part thereof, such attempted or purported assignment,
transfer, conveyance, sublease or other disposition shall be null, void and of no legal effect
whatsoever; and the Agreement may, at the option of the DISTRICT, be terminated, revoked and
annulled, and the DISTRICT shall thereupon be relieved and discharged from any and all liability
and obligations growing out of the same to the CONTRACTOR, and to its purported assignee or
transferee.

14, The CONTRACTOR shall maintain books, records, documents, and other evidence
and accounting procedures and practices, sufficient to reflect properly all costs of whatever nature
claimed to have been incurred and anticipated to be incurred for the performance of this
Agreement. The CONTRACTOR shall preserve and make available its records to the DISTRICT
and/or other representative agencies having a pecuniary or other bona fide interest in this
Agreement including designees of the interested parties for a period of five (5) years from the date
of expiration of this Agreement or until released in writing from this obligation by the DISTRICT.
The CONTRACTOR is responsible for any andit discrepancies involving any deviation from the
terms of this Agreement, and for any commitments or expenditures in excess of amounts allotted
by the DISTRICT.

15.  Any notice from one party to the other or otherwise under the Agreement shall be
in writing and shall be dated and signed by the party giving such notice or by a duly authorized
representative of such party. Any such notice shall not be effective for any purpose whatsoever
unless served in one of the following manners:

(D If notice is given to DISTRICT, by personal delivery thereof to DISTRICT,
or by depositing same in United States mail, enclosed in a sealed envelope
addressed to DISTRICT, and sent by registered or certified mail with
postage prepaid,;

@) If notice is given to CONTRACTOR, by personal delivery thereof to said
CONTRACTOR, or by depositing same in United States mail, enclosed in
a sealed envelope addressed to said CONTRACTOR at its regular place of
business or at such address as may have been established for the conduct of
work under this Agreement, and sent by registered or certified mail with
postage prepaid.

16.  BEach and every provision of law and clause required by law to be inserted in this
Agreement shall be deemed to be inserted herein and the Agreement shall be read and enforced as
though it were included herein, and if through mistake or otherwise any such provision is not
inserted, or is not currently inserted, then upon application of either party, the Agreement shall
forthwith be physically amended to make such insertion or correction.  The Agreement and
proposal documents are complementary. CONTRACTOR warrants and certifies that in the
performance of this Agreement, it will comply with all applicable statutes, laws, Tules, regulations
and orders of the United States, and of any state or political subdivision thereof, including laws

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Funiture & Equipment o “ I 5|Papge I
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and regulations pertaining to labor, wages, hours, and other conditions of employment, and
applicable price ceilings if any. The CONTRACTOR shall indemnify, hold harmless and defend
the DISTRICT against any and all actions, proceedings, penalties or claims arising out of the
failure to comply strictly with the IRCA. Failure of the DISTRICT to insist on the strict
performance of the terms and conditions of this Agreement shall not constitute or be construed as
a waiver or relinquishment of the DISTRICT rights thereafter to enforce strict compliance with
any such terms or conditions but the same shall continue in full force and effect.

17.  The parties to the Agreement shall be excused from performance during the time
and to the extent that they are prevented from obtaining, delivering or performing by act of God,
fire, or commandeering of materials, products, plants or facilities by the government, when
satisfactory evidence thereof is presented, provided that it is satisfactorily established that the non-
performance is not due to the fault or neglect of the party not performing.

18.  This Agreement constitutes the entire agreement of the parties. No other
agreements, oral or written, pertaining to the work to be performed, exists between the parties.
This Agreement can be modified only by an amendment in writing, signed by both parties and
pursuant to action of the Governing Board of the DISTRICT.

19.  The laws of the State of California shall govern the terms and conditions of this
Agreement with venue in the County of Orange.

20.  Each of the parties signing this Agreement warrants to the other that he or she has
the full authority of the entity on behalf of which his or her signature is made.

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Fumniture & Equipment . 6 l Pu g€
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IN WITNESS WHEREOF, the parties hereto have caused this Agreement to be executed.

DISTRICT CONTRACTOR
Irvine Unified Schoeol District

- (e
By: ; /?Z By: il
Sigry C \ Signatlire”
JohoAogarty %&‘Q‘{Or\ 6‘005
Print Name Print Name
Assistant Superintendent, Business Services %‘;{@
Title Title
July 7,2022 O-6-2021
Date Date

Irvine Unified School District
Board Approval Date June 28, 2022

Rid No. 2021/22-3F A, Furniture & Equipment
Agreement

Contractor’s License No.

56-229-3366

Tax ID No.

(Corporate Seal of Contractor,
if corporation)

7l|' IR
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TOBACCO USE POLICY

IRVINE UNIFIED SCHOOL DISTRICT
Irvine, California

In the interest of public health, the Irvine Unified School District provides a tobacco-frec
environment. Smoking or the use of any tobacco products are prohibited in buildings and vehicles,
and on any property owned, leased or contracted for, by the District. Failure to abide with this
requirement could result in the termination of this contract.

I acknowledge that I am aware of Tobacco Use Policy and hereby certify that I and my employees
will adhere to the requirements of the policy.

Hesto~ Evans

Name of Bidder

N

Signature

167 oLl

Date

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment 8|Pusav
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Labor Code section 3700.

"Every employer except the state shall secure the payment of compensation in one or more
of the following ways:

(a) By being insured against liability to pay compensation in one or more insurers duly
authorized to write compensation insurance in this state.

(b) By securing from the Director of Industrial Relations a certificate of consent to self-
insure either as an individual employer or as one employer in a group of employers, which may be
given upon furnishing proof satisfactory to the Director of Industrial Relations of ability to self-
insure and to pay any compensation that may become due to his or her employees.

(¢)  For any county, city, city and county, municipal corporation, public district, public
agency or any political subdivision of the state, including each member of a pooling arrangement
under a joint exercise of powers agreement (but not the state itself), by securing from the Director
of Industrial Relations a certificate of consent to self-insure against workers' compensation claims,
which certificate may be given upon furnishing proof satisfactory to the director of ability to
administer workers' compensation claims properly, and to pay workers' compensation claims that
may become due to its employees. On or before March 31, 1979, a political subdivision of the state
which, on December 31, 1978, was uninsured for its liability to pay compensation, shall file a
properly completed and executed application for a certificate of consent to self-insure against
workers' compensation claims. The certificate shall be issued and be subject to the provisions of
Section 3702."

1 am aware of the provisions of Labor Code section 3700 which require every employer to
be insured against liability for workers' compensation or to undertake self-insurance in accordance
with the provisions of that code, and I will comply with such provisions before commencing the

performance of the work of this contract. X . .
Oﬁ:%ﬁé Ergonome g}(d‘)m& ,'X(\o.

~ I
Name o ractor

By:

S'ignature

?re%*m Ewant

Print Name
Hesderr
Title

N1 100

Date

(In accordance with Article 5 [commencing at Section 1860], Chapter 1, Part 7, Division 2 of the
Labor Code, the above certificate must be signed and filed with the awarding body prior to
performing any work under the Agreement.)

Bid No, 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment LN RURT
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This Drug-Free Workplace Certification is required pursuant to Government Code section 8350 et
seq., the Drug-Free Workplace Act of 1990. The Drug-Free Workplace Act of 1990 requires that
every person or organization awarded a contract for the procurement of any property or services
from any State agency must certify that it will provide a drug-free workplace by doing certain
specified acts. In addition, the Act provides that each contract awarded by a State agency may be
subject to suspension of payments or termination of the contract and the contractor may be subject
to debarment from future contracting, if the state agency determines that specified acts have
occurred.

Pursuant to Government Code section 8355, every person or organization awarded a contract from
a State agency shall certify that it will provide a drug-free workplace by doing all of the following:

a) Publishing a statement notifying employees that the unlawful manufacture,
distribution, dispensation, possession or use of a controlled substance is prohibited in the person's
or organization's workplace and specifying actions which will be taken against employees for
violations of the prohibition;

b) Establishing a drug-free awareness program to inform employees about all of the
following:

D) The dangers of drug abuse in the workplace;

2) The person's or organization's policy of maintaining a drug-free workplace;

3) The availability of drug counseling, rehabilitation and employee-assistance
programs;

4) The penalties that may be imposed upon employees for drug abuse
violations;

c) Requiring that each employee engaged in the performance of the contract be given

a copy of the statement required by subdivision (a) and that, as a condition of employment on the
contract, the employee agrees to abide by the terms of the statement.

I, the undersigned, agree to fulfill the terms and requirements of Government Code section 8355
listed above and will publish a statement notifying employees concerning (a) the prohibition of
controlled substance at the workplace, (b) establishing a drug-free awareness program, and (c)
requiring that each employee engaged in the performance of the contract be given a copy of the
statement required by Section 8355(a) and requiring that the employee agree to abide by the terms
of that statement.

I also understand that if the District determines that 1 have either {a) made a false certification
berein, or (b) violated this certification by failing to carry out the requirements of Section 8355,
that the contract awarded herein is subject to suspension of payments, termination, or both. I

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Fumniture & Equipment ~ 18|Page
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further understand that, should I violate the terms of the Drug-Free Workplace Act of 1990, I may
be subject to debarment in accordance with the requirements of Section 8350 et seq.

[ acknowledge that I am aware of the provisions of Government Code section 8350 et seq. and
hereby certify that I will adhere to the requirements of the Drug-Free Workplace Act of 1990.

O(;E(‘?. k Emmom\tgoldm}xb ,Ipr;.

Wmcmr

Slgnature

Yeecton Byan®

Print Name

e IR

Title
q-G6-101 ~

Date

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment 11| Pay.
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REGAI LJRECORDS CHECK
EDUCATION CODE SECTION 45125.1

Education Code section 45125.1 provides that if the employees of any entity that has a
contract with a school district may have any contact with pupils, those employees shall submit or
have submitted their fingerprints in a manner authorized by the Department of Justice together
with a fee determined by the Department of Justice to be sufficient to reimburse the Department
for its costs incurred in processing the application.

The Department of Justice shall ascertain whether the individual whose fingerprints were
submitted to it has been arrested or convicted of any crime insofar as that fact can be ascertained
from information available to the Department. When the Department of Justice ascertains that an
individual whose fingerprints were submitted to it has a pending criminal proceeding for a violent
felony listed in Penal Code section 1192.7(c), or has been convicted of such a felony, the
Department shall notify the employer designated by the individual of the criminal information
pertaining to the individnal. The notification shall be delivered by telephone and shall be confirmed
in writing and delivered to the employer by first-class mail.

The contractor shall not permit an employee to come in contact with pupils until the
Department of Justice has ascertained that the employee has not been convicted of a violent
or serious felony. The contractor shall certify in writing to the governing beard of the school
district that none of its employees who may come in contact with pupils have been convicted
of a violent or serious felony.

Penal Code section 667.5(c) lists the following “violent” felonies: murder; voluntary
manslaughter; mayhem; rape; sodomy by force; oral copulation by force; lewd acts on a child
under the age of 14 years; any felony punishable by death or imprisonment in the state prison for
life; any felony in which the defendant inflicts great bodily injury on another; any robbery
perpetrated in an inhabited dwelling; arson; penetration of a person’s genital or anal openings by
foreign or unknown objects against the victim’s will; attempted murder; explosion or attempt to
explode or ignite a destructive device or explosive with the intent to commit murder; kidnapping;
continuous sexual abuse of a child; and carjacking.

Penal Code section 1192.7 lists the following “serious” felonies: murder; voluntary
manslaughter; mayhem; rape; sodomy by force; oral copulation by force; a lewd or lascivious act
on a child under the age of 14 years; any felony punishable by death or imprisonment in the state
prison for life; any felony in which the defendant personally inflicts great bodily injury on another,
or in which the defendant personally uses a firearm; attempted murder; assault with intent to
commit rape or robbery; assault with a deadly weapon on a peace officer; assault by a life prisoner
on a noninmate; assault with a deadly weapon by an inmate; arson; exploding a destructive device
with intent to injure or to murder, or explosion causing great bodily injury or mayhem; burglary
of an inhabited dwelling; robbery or bank robbery; kidnapping; holding of a hostage by a person
confined in a state prison; attempt to commit a felony punishable by death or imprisonment in the
state prison for life; any felony in which the defendant personally uses a dangerous or deadly
weapon; selling or furnishing specified controlied substances to a minor; penetration of genital or
anal openings by foreign objects against the victim’s will; grand theft involving a firearm;
carjacking; and a conspiracy to commit specified controlled substances offenses.

Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment . o ) a2 | Pa 2 c
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CERTIFICATION BY CONTRACTOR

CRIMINAL RECORDS CHECK
AB 1610, 1612 and 2102

To the Governing Board of Irvine Unified School District:

- : e
1, Offfce. ¥ Ergorapie Sduhars_ certify that:
Name ol Contractor

1. I have carefully read and understand the Notice Regarding Criminal Records Check
(Education Code section 45125.1) required by the passage of AB 1610, 1612 and 2102.

2. Due to the nature of the work I will be performing for the Districts, my employees may
have contact with students of the Districts.

3. None of the employces who will be performing the work have been convicted of a violent
or scrious felony as defined in the Notice and in Penal Code section 1192.7 and this
determination was made by a fingerprint check through the Department of Justice.

I declare under penalty of perjury that the foregoing is true and correct.

Executed at 2oz Cucepdnoe. |, Californiaon " & 202~
Sif;ﬁ{?fure
Yeeston Evans

Typed or printed name

Yosideat

Title
Hd Vhico oz - Tache G.mmjo Lo WO
Address
10~ 527-46M2
Telephone
Bid No. 2021/22-3FA, Furniture & Equipment 1B3|Page
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Demco, inc

GM Buslness imteriars

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment
Bld Results

Materials, LiC

Laiceshore Leammifng g pynweli- Craig

Office & Ergonomic  Seating Component . Speciatty, LLC

Sclutiors, inc Manufacturing

Sierra Schaol Southwest Schoo! &
Equipmernt Congrany Office Supply

DRAFT: Bld Resulis Onty; Does nat Constitute Award

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Cnterprises
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10 |Noft NoBld C00Ts No Bld NoBid No B NoBid No Bld Na Bld NoBld 62.00% NaoBid NoBid No Bl NoBd
1 |Carste Mivodsia | Do/ Srams [Hete NoBid sao% NabBid NoBid NoBK NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid a200% NoBid Nosid NoBid NoBld
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) TR NON.SPECIFIED TEMS NoBid saoo% Nabd NoBid Nokd Nogld NoBid NoBld NoBld e e o NaBid Nogid No Bld NoBMd
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Fumniture and Equipment
Bid Results

Core Business A Lakeshare Learning Qﬁonmm_.wﬂ_grmmuuqﬁgg mmqnwﬂi mﬂ::iﬂﬂmn:on..b O, IN v, .
Interiors Culver-Newlin Dema, Inc GM Business Intericrs Materials, (LC MeDowell- Craig Soiutions. Inc. Manfacturing School Specialty, LL.C Equipment Company Office Saprly VIRCC, INC. ‘amada Enterprises

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

B
Lina
btamd
17
1
ChairsoiStol, (Task chakr s stol witn
19 i — NoBU NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBK NoBld NoBid 4200% NoBkd NoBl Mo Bid NoBid NoBHd HoBid
» Mode: ASWAS, el bockbaxand NoBx! NoB4 NoBig NoEid NaBU NoBld NoBid 4200% NoBkd NoBM NoBid NoBU NaBid NoBd
ASWAS ——
Arise
n e arpar (Pom NoBUd NoBd Mo s NoBud NoBid NoBld NoBid 4200% NoBid NoBid Mo Bld NoBkd NoBid NoBM
2 Stn Tatda Pyramid, Tepmr sl NoBid WoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBd 4200% Nl NoBM NoBid NoBid Mo Bid NoBid
Teardrop
Mode ASMOV, MOV s, Bloc, STPEXP
2 ATy I NoBU NaBld Mo Bid NoBid NoBHd NoBid Mo Bid 4200% NoBld NoBld Nold NeBid NoBkd NoBid
Chair, Cantlaver ([18°F:four og seackiog
P ik e NoBM NoBKd NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid Mo Bid 4200% NoBid NoBUd NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid
L ek DXOA D10, I
e
= ModakDsT-RC_,  (BPenes. Aoerur, NoBld NoBid No NoBkd NoBid NoBid Mo Bid 4200% NoBl Noad NoBid NoBid NoBid N Bl
DST-BX. DST-AP_
3P-120, Apurturs,
% | DwmwSwia (HmaTade Sy Gy Noods, NoBld NoBd NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBId NoBUd 4200% NoBd NoBd NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBY
z Cate Taties (Caté tatdes with bases NoBld NoBid NoBd NoBid NoBid NoBU NoBid 200% NoBU NoBid NoBid NoBld No B NoBld
» [lovrioTmend Mt No B NoBid NoBid NoBid NaBid NoBid NoBd 4200% NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBd NoBid
» acentDel fu NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid 4200% NoBkd NoBd Nopid NoBkd NoBid NoBid
[Hormhos, rectangular,
x Aty T oo e, NaBld NoBid No Bl NoBid NoBid NoBld Nobid 4200% NoBId No B NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBM
ARTCO-BELL
n P e o NoBid NoBK Mo B NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid 4200 NoBl NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBkd NoBid

Page20f 17



Bld 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bld Resuits Only: Does not Canstitute Award

Furntture and Equipment
Bid Results

: iness N ’ .. iakeshoreieaming g | (Offc=SEgmanic  Seming Compent Siemaschod!  SouthwestScool& ,
s o Cuiver-Newlin Demoo,lnc  GMBusinessinteriors = LR McDawe e o o SchoolSpedaity, L o o e Serety ViRCOINC  Yamada Erterprises
IRVINE UNIFIED

SCHOOL DISTRICT

» = — 4210% 40.00% No EBld NoBid 3660% NoBid No Bl 42.50% NoBld NoBid NoBid 20.00% NoBld HoBid
|Frowstanding, Wall MR
{Dlspiwys & Trophy  {and Recesssd Cases.
40 Alursirun & Wood 439 40.00% NoBld NoBid 3680% Nold NoBid 4250% NoBid NoBld NoBld 20.00% NoBld HoBid
41 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS 4310% 40.00% NoBid NaoBid 3650% NoBid No Bid A4250% No Bld NoBld NoBld 10.00% NoBid NoBid

L R e e i tad Page3of17



Bid 2021/22-3FA DIRAFT: Bld Results Only; Does not Constlturta Award

d\.wﬁz_m UNIFIED = =3 Cuvr-Newin  Demconc M Busnessimeriors UL meoowel iy SIS SO senoc coucibyuc g ST SOt S
SCHOOL DISTRICT :

2 odinary . R = I7.00% 45.00% No Bid Na Bid 48.00% No Bid No Bid 1.50% NoBid 42.00% 2050% No Bid No Bld NoBld
a |Art & Drofting Tabins Too0% 4so0% NoBid NoBld 4n00% NaBld NoBid 1.50% NoBid «00% 2a50% Nomd No B HNoBid
“ (Rebotics, 7.00% 45.00% NoBid NoBid 4a00% NoBid Nomld 4150% NoBid 4200% 250% NoBl Nomd Nomd
|'Storags Cablirmts
{Mutal & Stoul Frams,
« Tamperad mo0% 45.00% NoBld NoBid @00x NoBid Nobid 150% Notid 4200% S350 NoBid NoBid Notild
% e ® | putcher Bock 7.00% 45.00% NoBid Nog 4800% NoBid NoBd 4L50% NoBl 4200% 250% NoBid NoBld HoBid




Bld 2021/22-3FA ORAFT: Bid Results Only; Does not Constitute Award

Furniture and Equipment.
Bld Resulis

E2EE ey Culver-Newtin Demcninc  GMBusiness imeriors NSOTELEAMTINg oy ooy OfficeSErgmomic  SeatngComponem oy pegiapy, (e | SeTascheol  SouiwestSchool&  yipeg iNC Yamada Emerprises

irteriors Materials, LLC Salutions, inc. Manifacturing Equlpment Compay  Office Supply

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

B e PRHLTT + I Frninry ey « bl et Page50f17



N\

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

C

uver-Newlin

Demca, lnc GM Business interiors Exmzﬁmrmh:zé McDoweli- Craig

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Bid Results

Materials,

Ciffice & Erganamic
Soiutians, inc.

unmnm.haunx._};
M - Schoci Speciatty, LEC

Sierra School

DRAFT: Bld Results Cndy; Does not Constitute Award

Scuthwest Schogl &

Equipment Company  Office Supply

VIRCO, tNC. Yamada Emterprises:

{Dasidng, Tables & T Parmling,
n |Paeiizn Systarm |Offica, Claswrooma ete. 47.30% 52.00% NoBid NoHid WA NeBid No Bid 44.60% NoBid Z7.00% NoBid No Bid NoBld NoBid
72 |FRngk Storage {All Stylex & Mainls | Padustals, Soaciaity 47.30% 5200% NoBld Na Bid 3020% NoBid NoBid A660% NoBid Z7.00% NoBid No Bid NoBK NoBid
{Stormgs (Inchuling mohha}

47.30%

Total Offica 27% OTG
s

No Bld

NoBid

Lo Categary mtior

|| B 5arten Pt Deacription

7 ALLSEATINGPRODUCTS Nobid Nolid Namid No Bkl e NoBid Nomid NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBud NoBid Lo0%
LAY

7 OTHER oS (TEMS NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid ‘Se0 Omnla Contract NoBid NoBid Nomd NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NaBid 100%

Pagebof17



Bid 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bd Results Only; Does not Constitute Award

Fumniture and Equipment
Bid Results
< iness 5 J . - . _hrﬂgﬁE_J.:n r Office & Ergonomic mnmzﬁrbavosﬁa Sierra Schodt Soutnwest Schaol & 3
Tnteri pe dver-Newlin Demeg, inc GM Business Interiors Materiais, L1C MeDoweii- Craig Solutions e Schoo! Spedaity. 1LC Equic = ) Office Supply VIRCO,INC Yamada Enterprises
IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT i

Panels 635X Tahla &
Dasis 57.8%

I
:
:
s

NoBid 5.00%

;
§
3
;
b
§

NoBid S.00%




Bid 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bld Results Onty; Does not Constitute Award

Furnitisre and Equipment
Bld Results
i - n Lakeshore Learnil Office & Ergonomic vmun.:mngg» Sierra School Southwest School & .
v e iver-Newdin Demasinc  GMBusinemsinteriors 2L ST McDowell-Crag S " Schoo Soeciaity,LLC . - 5 Tt VIRCO,INC  Yamada Erterprises
\\_aSz_m UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

e S o - .:} No Bid NoBid NoBld No Bid NoBl S00% No Bid NoBK NoBld NoBid No Bld NoBit NoBid NoBid

{Bookstands, Cota, No Bl NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid 6.00% NoBid No Bid NoBld NoBid NoBld No Bld NoBld NoBid

93 [hmtii; Home {Soft Seating erd ‘Comfy Chur, Tables, NoBWl NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBld A00% No Bid NoBid No Bid NoBid NoBid NoBid No B NoBld

%4 fOuuiaar [Outdoor Furniture  (Tiabskes, Senches, Loungsr, No Hd NoBid NaBid NoBld No Bl 400% NaBld NoBK No Bid Ne Bid No Bild No Bid NaBld NoBid
(Classroom Carpety | Clavsroo Carpets and

] |t R Fugs, Multiple Stzex No Bl NoBid No Bid NoBld NoBid &00% No Bld NoBld NoBid NoBld Nolld NoBid NoBK NaBid

96 gﬁiﬂ_gz_m_mg NoBld NoBid Na Bid NoBld NoBid 600% NoBid NeBid No Bl NoBid NoBid No Bl No Bid No Bid

e v BT - A Dty g - B s Page8of 17



IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Culver:Newiic

Demea, inc

GMBusinessinteriors LKETOTELEAING  y oy craig

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment
Bid Results

Materiais 11C

Cffice & Ergonomic  SeadngCamponent ¢ ooy

Solutions, Inc. Marnufacturing

Sierra School Southwest School &
Equipment Compary Office Supply

DRAFT: Bld Resuits Only; Doss not Constiute Award

VIRCO, INC.

Yamada Enterprises

‘Whitsboars and/r
[ Neuting Mabile Filp  [Laminste tops, mfustubla
e i NoBU NoBld NoBid NoBM NoBid NoBld s500% NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBK NoBid NoBid NoBid
twith vertical lock aption
|schanca i tables and
104 et T oot dimerin NoBM NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBd ss.00% NoBld NoBld NoBK NoBld NoBld NoBld NoEM
L atoeal & Vartica | Sreiard whth ock a
108 e orscal e catints, achuotatio shel NoBid NoBd Nomd NoBld NoBid NoBid 4s00% Nomid NoBld NoEid NoBid NoBld NoBid Nosid
(bookcase
106 ota Trmy Carts it |P-ia il oo prarcalain NoBud NoBid NoBd NoBld NoBid NoBld 55008 Noud NoB NoBid NoRid NoBid NoBis RoBld
(ocking casters
107 Py e NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBM NoBid NoBid s500% NoBid NoBid NoBld NoRid NoBid NoBld NoBld
Line Catagory mdior
mey|  Brand/surtes e Dwecription
MOORECO dufTace
1068 T et O Tl NoBM 45.00% 200% T sa20% NoBld NoBid 29.50% NoBid 24008 NoBid 1000% NoBM Nogid
Othar tam 5%




qﬂ

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

Demea, inc GM Business irericrs

Bid Results

Lakeshore Learning
Materiais, LLC R

Office & Ergonamic

Sofutions, Inc.

Mmmaqﬁnﬁgﬂ..ﬂ_»
s g School spediatty, LLC

DRAFT: Bid Resuits Only: Does not Constituta Award

Sierra School Southwest School &
Equipment Company Office Supply

VIRCC, INC. Yamada Emterprises

um Catagary and/or
hemp| Orod/Swie Nodel § Description
|&* Ractanguitar Partatie
Custdoor | Table,
144 [Tabla | o pt2am with NoBid NoBid NoBid Nold NoBid NoBid Nomd List+9.5% s.00% NoBid NoBKd NoBld NoBid NoBid
Modak: TR | matching frasmm arei top
|t finish
Kiraler halght: 46" Round
RowdOutior | Portabila Telde, expanded
15 [Tabie amtal, diamcd pttern NoBld NoBid Nomd NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid Ust+ 9.5% S00% NoBid NoBid NoBId Nosid NoBid
Modet: TRDSG_  (with miching frama mnd
top pain finish
i  Commriat
T
iRousd Ovoor | Portatae Table, ganded
16 Tabla |matal, diamond pettam NoBid NoBid NaBid NaBid NoBid NoBid NoBd Uist+95% s00% NoBid Nomd NoBld NoBwl Nod
Modak: TRDAG_. with mwtching frame and
kop paint finish
146" Seuare Portable Tabla,
SamreQuitoor | e o, dlamond
17 Table i i NoBid Nagid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid List+95% L00% NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBid
Mo TSQMA- | and top peint firish
MYTCQAT -
18 e R SreCiaeD ITEMS Nol NoBld NoBid NaBid NoBid NoBid NoBid List+9.5% 500% Nold NoBid NoBid NoBid Nobid

L e e LT

Page 100f 17



l=m#

W\_mSZm UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

Category and/or
Madel #

ContBusinesy Culver:Newlln

Interiors

Demcn, Inc.

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Furniture and Equipment

GM Business Interiors

Bid Results

Lakeshare Learning

Materials, LLC

Office & Ergonomic

‘McDowell- Cralg Salutions, Inc

Seating Camponent. ‘Schocil Speciaity, 1LC

Manufactiring

SierraSchodl Sautimwest School &
Equipment Comgaay Office Supply

DHRAFT Bl Remsetz Qaly, Dot not Convtitile Awesrd

VIRCO, INC.

‘OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED ITEMS

129 AVPresentation  |Lecterns & Podiums NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBId
150 TechFumiturs [ & Charging NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBIG NoBId NoBid NaBld NoBld NoBid 3400% NoBld NoBld NoBId NoBid
131 OKLAHOMASOMD, NoBld NoBId NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBld NoBid 3400% NaBld NoBld NoBid NoBld

133 [Shelvirg jBookceses & Boak Truck NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBld No Bld NoBld No Bld 2110% No Bid NoBld 10.00% No 8ld NoBid 500%
PALMER HAMILTON Ser ottached discount
134 OTHER: NON-SPECIFIED (TEMS NoBid NoBld Nao8id NoBld NaBld NoBld No Bld 21.10% NoBld No Bl structure NoBld NoBid 5.00%

| Brand/series Bk Deseription

135 ALL BQARDS PRODUCT {ALL SERIES) No Bid No8id 45.00% No Bld 434AT% NoBid NoBld No Bld NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBld
134 qﬂu—’%lhk‘ﬁbﬁ__-—“mhﬂam NoBld NoBld 4500% NoBid 43.40% NoBld NaBld NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBld No Bl NoBld NoBld
iU | Brand/saries | Cotagoryandior Deaiption

137 PERCENTAE E O ALICAT R e rente aa70% 40.00% 25.00% NaBId sa20% NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBi 2700% NoBld 25.00% NoBId NoBid
_“ﬂ o| Brond/Ser Qﬂﬂé . Desaription

138 |Alistyie Al Modals Student Dasis & Tatdes NoBid 53.00% NoBid NoBld NoBld NosBid NoBld NoBld NoBId NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBId NoBld
139 [l Styles At Modata |att Saating NoBId 5200% NoBId NoBld NoBId NoBld NoBld Nosld NoBid NoBId NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid
140 |Allstyles Al Modets |Collaborative Scft Seating NoBid 5200% NoBld NoBid NoBId NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBikd NoBld
141 Pt NoBid sa0m% NoBid Nogid NoBld Nogld NoBId NoBld NoBId NoBid Nogid NoBld NoBid N Bid

81 No 2071727+

€4 Furniture

Page 120117



N.\\.wﬁz_m UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

GM Business [nteriors

Bid 2021/22-3FA

U = McDoweli-Craig

Matersals,

Office & Ergonomic  Seating Component Schodl Speciaity, LT

Sowtions. inc.

Manufactiring

DRAFT: Bid Resuits Only; Does not Constitrte Award

Sierra Schooi Sauthwest School &
Equipment Compary Office Scppiy

VIRCG.INC.

Yamada Enterprises

150 (Al Stylm | Confaranca NoBid No Bid NoBid 5550% NoBld Na Bid 57.50% No Bl NoBld 50.00% NoBid NoBkd 1000%
SITON IT SEATING
151 OTHER: NON-SPECIFED [TEMS NoBld Nobid NoBM 5550% NoBid NoBd 5750% NoBKl NoBld 5000% NoBid NoBid

10 b PO+ TP Pt gt - Bt Rt

Page 130f 17



Bid 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bld Results Only: Does not Constltute Award

Furniture and Equipment
Bid Results

ﬂ Core Business q 1 a 4 Lakesnore Learning Office &Ergonomic  Seating Camponent. Sierra School Sauthwest School & = .
\ 2 R Culver-Newliin Demco, inc GM Business Imeriars Materials, LLC McDaweli- Craig Soluticns, inc. A e Schooi Specialty, LLC Equl Com Office Surply VIRCO, INC. Yamada Emerprises

IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT

152 (imercmngs s e NoBid NoBld 2000% Nolud Nobd Nobid No Bld No B NoBid NoBid Nad NoBid NoBld 200%
159 |Shovetin Pohdenk ducks,takdes, NoBld NoEMd 2000% NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nod NoBid NoBld NoBld NaBld NoBk 200%
154 [Fiax [ Saudors: dask, tablos, NoBid NoBid 30.00% NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NaBid NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBud 200%
158 |wa Pasient desk, tabler, NoBld NoBid 3000% NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBsd NoBid NoBld 200%
156 |Clamantal [Phucdent deks, tades, NoBM NoBld %000% NoBK NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid 200%
157 |Plomer [ohuders deska, tables, NoBid NoBid 3000% NoBu NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid 200%
156 | AN Seyies & Models  |AR Sesting NoBid NaBid 2000% NoBid NoBu NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBid 200%
159 |Cascara Storwgn il NoBil NoBid 3000% NoBid No B NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBld NoBid Nogid NoBu NoBld 200%
10 {Book Trudks NoBid NoBid saoox% NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBkd NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBid 200%

169 ety NoBid NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nomid NoBi NoBKd NoBid NoBu NoRM NoBid Lo
164 (verb it NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NaBid NoBid NaBid NaBid NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBld 100%
165 [Verb [Tetten NoEM NoBid NoBd NoBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nogid NoBld NoBld NoBid NoRM NoBid 100%
106 |Atghe i NoBid NoBid Nod NoBid NoBild Nogid NoBud NoRld NoBM NoBid NoBid NoRMd NoBld 100%
167 |Campiire Ottrmam Isoft Samtirg NoBM NaBld NoBid NoBld NaBid NoBid NoBid NoBid Nold Nogid NoBid NoBid NoBid 100%
18 T N R NoBid NoBid No B NoBid NoBkd NoBld NoBud NoBid NoRid NoBld NoBid NoBid Nomd 100%

B0 o 202:/22 - 3FA Furniure Equlpment Bt Realt . Page 140 17



Bid 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bid Resuits Only; Does nat Constitute Award

Furntture 2nd Equipment
Bid Results

IRVINE UNIFIED

N iness = J . iakeshore Leaning Office & Erganomic mmuéngg Sierra Schoal Southwest Sehool & A X
\ § , Newdin Demad.lnc  GMBusinessimeriors - e, ST McDaweil- Craig et oot Schooi Speciaity LC ¢ Commparry . Offios Sunply VIRCO,INC.  Yamada Ererprises
SCHOOL DISTRICT

160 |0 Stvien AN Modata [Carference i Flps NoBM NoBld NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBid NoBid 52.50% No Bk NoBMd 50.00% Nomid NoBd 1000%
170 Al Styles {All Madaly 'Banches & Power Bridgs NoBK NoBld NoBid NoBld NoBld NoBid NoBid 52.50% NoBld NoBid 50.00% NoBld No Bld 10.00%
171 |Ai Stylem IAD Moxdely 1St/Sand Tables & Urits NoBid No Bid NoBld No Bid No Bld NoBid No Bl 52.50% NoBK NoBld S000% No Bld No Bld 1000%
172 as‘éng No Bid NoBid NoBld NoEMd NoBld NoBid No Bld S2.80% No Bid NoBld 50.00% NoBid NoBld 10.00%

* Page 150f 17



DRAFT: Bld Results Cnly; Does not Constttute Award

Bid 2021/22-3FA
Fummiture and Equipment
Bid Results

SiemaSchool - SouthwestShaoi®  yvipe INC Yamada Emerprises

o e o School Speciafty. LS ¢ o wipment Company Office Supply

Lakeshore Learning McDowell- Craig R

i Iné w. lver-Newiin Desrco, inc. GM Business Interiors S Y
V\\.mSZm UNIFIED Materts, (1€ ot e
SCHOOL DISTRICT [

NoBid

NoBid No Bid NoBld 500% List+56% No Bid NobBid

NoBK No Bl NoEd

enchis & o in-ground logs, 22 gul, NoBid NaBid ax NoBld Quota

(b
NoBid Quotn No Bld No Bld NoBid NoBl S00% Lst+56% No Bl NoBid NoBld

i NoBld NoBid 4%

Page 160f 17



Bid 2021/22-3FA DRAFT: Bld Results Only; Does not Constliute Award

Furniture and Equipment
Bid Resutts
. Office & Ergonamil Seating Cemponent Sit School Southy School&
C Jung 1 - erTd west - - 3
- £ 5 z AL S e Schooi SpeciahtyLLC TS T VIRCO,INC  Yamada Enterprises
IRVINE UNIFIED
SCHOOL DISTRICT T . n | '
TS
92 |Lobo NoBid NoRid No®id 1L00% 5430% NoBid Nomid 5450% NoBid a600% 45.00% NoBid Nolid NoBid
Tables: Butcher
- i, Prarolic, Stalniess
Stnel "
93 |fara NoBId NoBid NoBid 1L.00% 54.30% NoBid NoBid s460% No B 46.00% 4s00% NoBid NoBid NoEid
94 AD siyle A Models it MlcSeon NoBld NoBid NaBld 1L.00% 54.90% NoBid NoBld 5460% NoBid 46.00% 45.00% NoBkd NoBid NoBid
95 (NI Styles A Models stocle NoBl NoBid NoBid 100% sa50% NoBid Notd s450% NoBid 46.00% 4500% NoBid NoBud NoBl






