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Contact Line Item # (CLIN) Description UNSPSC Unit of Measure
(UOM)

Quantity in 
Unit of 

Measure
Make Model Vehicle Contract Unit Price Maintenance Plan Contract Unit 

Price Dealer Contract Number 

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 SUBARU OUTABCK *$30,940.00* $1,145.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 SUBARU FORESTER $28,810.00 $1,145.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 JEEP COMPASS $29,670.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 VW TIGUAN $31,100.00 $1,325.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NISSAN ROGUE $23,994.00 $895.00 LITHIA NISSAN OF FRESNO 1-22-23-23A

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 HYUNDAI TUCSON *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $1,800.00 US FLEET SOURCE 1-22-23-23H

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET EQUINOX *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $1,095.00 WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

1

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 165 HP, 103 in. WB, 
59 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD ESCAPE $24,805.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 TOYOTA HIGHLANDER $34,017.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

Fleet Vehicles - Vans & SUVs
Attachment A - Contract Pricing *Supplement 2*
Contract 1-22-23-23 (A-I)
Payment Terms for Contracts 1-22-23-23A-G (Excludes Contracts H & I)
$500 discount per vehicle for payment within 20 days      



2

Contact Line Item # (CLIN) Description UNSPSC Unit of Measure
(UOM)

Quantity in 
Unit of 

Measure
Make Model Vehicle Contract Unit Price Maintenance Plan Contract Unit 

Price Dealer Contract Number 

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NISSAN PATHFINDER $30,819.00 $895.00 LITHIA NISSAN OF FRESNO 1-22-23-23A

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 HONDA PILOT $38,383.00 $1,195.00 OCEAN HONDA 1-22-23-23B

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 HYUNDAI PALISADE *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $2,100.00 US FLEET SOURCE 1-22-23-23H

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET TRAVERSE *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $749.00 CA CAR GROUP 1-22-23-23I

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 DODGE DURANGO $40,400.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

2

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 275 HP, 109 in. WB, 
80 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD EXPLORER $29,840.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

3

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 8-
Passenger, 350 HP, 116 in. WB, 
94 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 TOYOTA SEQUOIA $49,015.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

3

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 8-
Passenger, 350 HP, 116 in. WB, 
94 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET TAHOE *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $1,095.00 WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

3

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 8-
Passenger, 350 HP, 116 in. WB, 
94 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD EXPEDITION $42,800.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

4

Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 9-
Passenger, 350 HP, 130 in. WB, 
120 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET SUBURBAN *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $1,095.00 WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

5

Small Sport Utility, AWD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 AUDI Q4 E-TRON $58,300.00 $2,130.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E
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5

Small Sport Utility, AWD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 VW iD4 PRO $48,220.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

5

Small Sport Utility, AWD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD MACH-E SELECT $44,599.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

6

Small Sport Utility, AWD, 5-
Passenger, 250 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID

7

Small Sport Utility, AWD, 5-
Passenger, 300 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID

8

Small Sport Utility, 2WD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 AUDI Q4 E-TRON $52,500.00 $2,130.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

8

Small Sport Utility, 2WD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 VW iD4 PRO $45,600.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

8

Small Sport Utility, 2WD, 5-
Passenger, 200 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD MACH-E SELECT $47,299.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

9

Small Sport Utility, 2WD, 5-
Passenger, 250 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 VW iD4 PRO $45,601.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

10

Small Sport Utility, 2WD, 5-
Passenger, 300 RANGE, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101508 Each 1 NO BID

11

Small Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 5-
Passenger, 130 HP, DIESEL 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 JEEP WRANGLER SPORT $42,320.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

12

Standard Sport Utility, 4x4 or AWD, 
5-Passenger, 240 HP, DIESEL 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 CHEVROLET TAHOE *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $1,640.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

13

Small Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, 
HYBRID-ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA RAV4 $27,073.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

13

Small Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, 
HYBRID-ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 HONDA CR-V $31,697.00 $1,195.00 OCEAN HONDA 1-22-23-23B
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13

Small Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, 
HYBRID-ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 HYUNDAI SANTA FE HYBRID BLUE *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $2,100.00 US FLEET SOURCE 1-22-23-23H

13

Small Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, 
HYBRID-ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD ESCAPE $24,915.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

14

Sport Utility, 7-Passenger, HYBRID-
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA HIGLANDER $37,330.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

14

Sport Utility, 7-Passenger, HYBRID-
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 FORD EXPLORER $45,380.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

15

Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, PLUG-
IN HYBRID ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD ESCAPE $29,450.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

15

Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, PLUG-
IN HYBRID ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 SUBARU CROSSTREK *$39,318.00* $1,145.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

15

Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, PLUG-
IN HYBRID ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA RAV4 PRIME $37,875.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

15

Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, PLUG-
IN HYBRID ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 HYUNDAI SANTA FE PHEV *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* $2,100.00 US FLEET SOURCE 1-22-23-23H

16

Sport Utility, AWD, 7-Passenger,  
200 RANGE, ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 NO BID

17

Sport Utility, AWD, 7-Passenger, 
300 RANGE, ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 NO BID

18

Sport Utility, 2WD, 7-passenger, 
200 RANGE, ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101506 Each 1 NO BID

19

Sport Utility, 2WD, 7-Passenger, 
300 RANGE, ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID

20

Sport Utility, 5-Passenger, FUEL 
CELL Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 NO BID



5

Contact Line Item # (CLIN) Description UNSPSC Unit of Measure
(UOM)

Quantity in 
Unit of 

Measure
Make Model Vehicle Contract Unit Price Maintenance Plan Contract Unit 

Price Dealer Contract Number 

21

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 5-
Passenger, 170 HP, 8 in. of 
Ground Clearance, GASOLINE 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 SUBARU CROSSTREK *$30,650.00* $1,145.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

21

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 5-
Passenger, 170 HP, 8 in. of 
Ground Clearance, GASOLINE 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD BRONCO SPORT $25,449.00 $1,340.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

22

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 4-
Passenger, 260 HP, 105 in. 
(Maximum) WB, 8 in. of Ground 
Clearance, GASOLINE Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 JEEP WRANGLER SPORT *$42,628.00* $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

22

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 4-
Passenger, 260 HP, 105 in. 
(Maximum) WB, 8 in. of Ground 
Clearance, GASOLINE Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD BRONCO $28,339.00 $1,340.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

23

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 5-
Passenger, 260 HP, 8 in. of 
Ground Clearance, GASOLINE 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 JEEP WRANGLER *$42,628.00* $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

23

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 5-
Passenger, 260 HP, 8 in. of 
Ground Clearance, GASOLINE 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA 4RUNNER *$38,279.00* $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

23

Sport Utility, 4x4 Off-Road, 5-
Passenger, 260 HP, 8 in. of 
Ground Clearance, GASOLINE 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD BRONCO $32,168.00 $1,340.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

24

Minivan, 7-Passenger, 170 HP, 114 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 CHRYSLER VOYAGER LX $34,230.00 $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

24

Minivan, 7-Passenger, 170 HP, 114 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 HONDA ODYSSEY *$37,850* $1,195.00 OCEAN HONDA 1-22-23-23B

24A

Minivan, 7-Passenger, 170 HP, 114 
in. WB, HYBRID Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA SIENNA $31,810.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

25

Minivan, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 170 HP, 114 in. WB, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 CHRYSLER PACIFICA TOURING *$44,890.00* $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E
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25A

Minivan, 4x4 or AWD, 7-
Passenger, 170 HP, 114 in. WB, 
HYBRID Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 TOYOTA SIENNA $33,560.00 $895.00 FREEWAY TOYOTA OF HANFORD 1-22-23-23C

26

Minivan, 7-Passenger, 170 HP, 114 
in. WB, E85 Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 NO BID

27

Minivan, 7-Passenger, PLUG-IN 
HYBRID ELECTRIC Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 CHRYSLER PACIFICA TOURING *$51,110.00* $1,095.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

[28

Van, 8-Passenger, 260 HP, 130 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101505 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-150 $38,915.00 $1,340.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G]

29

Van, 12-Passenger, 260 HP, 135 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 CHEVROLET EXPRESS *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

29

Van, 12-Passenger, 260 HP, 135 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101505 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT XL $38,937.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

30

Van, 15-Passenger, 260 HP, 145 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET EXPRESS *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

30

Van, 15-Passenger, 260 HP, 145 
in. WB, GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT XL $40,222.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

31

Cargo Minivan, 130 HP, 114 in. 
WB, 120 cu. ft. Cargo Volume, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT CONNECT $24,800.00 $499.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

32

Cargo Van, 270 HP, 135 in. WB, 
8500 GVWR, GASOLINE Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET EXPRESS *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

32

Cargo Van, 270 HP, 135 in. WB, 
8500 GVWR, GASOLINE Fueled 
Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT XL $33,310.00 DOWNTOWN FORD 1-22-23-23F

33

Cargo Van, 290 lb.-ft. Torque, 135 
in. WB, 8500 GVWR, DIESEL 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 CHEVROLET EXPRESS *CURRENTLY UNAVAILABLE* WINNER CHEVROLET 1-22-23-23D

34

Cargo Van, 135 in. WB, 8500 
GVWR, CNG Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID
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35

Cargo Van, High Ceiling, 270 HP, 
135 in. WB, 8500 GVWR, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 RAM PROMASTER $40,040.00 ELK GROVE AUTO 1-22-23-23E

35

Cargo Van, High Ceiling, 270 HP, 
135 in. WB, 8500 GVWR, 
GASOLINE Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-250 $37,752.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

36

Cargo Van, High Ceiling, 290 lb.-ft. 
Torque, 135 in. WB, 8500 GVWR, 
DIESEL Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID

37

Cargo Van, High Ceiling, 8500 
GVWR, CNG Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 NO BID

38

Cargo Van, 130 in. WB, 120 Mile 
Range ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $44,995.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

39

Cargo Van,140 in. WB, 120 Mile 
Range  ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $46,172.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

40

Cargo Van, 140 in. WB, 110 Mile 
Range ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle 
in accordance with specification 
2310-4181 dated 8/16/21

25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $46,172.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

41

Cargo Van, High Ceiling, 140 in. 
WB, 100 Mile Range, ELECTRIC 
Fueled Vehicle in accordance with 
specification 2310-4181 dated 
8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $49,221.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

42

Cargo Van, Chassis Cab, 178in. 
WB, ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $41,728.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G

43

Cargo Van, Cutaway, 178 in. WB, 
ELECTRIC Fueled Vehicle in 
accordance with specification 2310-
4181 dated 8/16/21 25101507 Each 1 FORD TRANSIT T-350 XL $41,212.00 WATSONVILLE FLEET GROUP 1-22-23-23G
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Description Unit of Measure Quantity in Unit of Make Model Manufacturer Contract Unit Price 
Additional options, (cost plus) various various n/a n/a n/a Dealer Cost up to + 10 %
Removal of options, (cost minus) various various n/a n/a n/a Dealer Cost up to + 10 %

End of Sheet

The following items are applicable for options only.


	Vans & SUVs 1-22-23-23A-I 

