

**EXHIBIT A - BID NO. 2223-01 - PAPER AND PLASTIC PRODUCTS FOR FOOD AND NUTRITION SERVICES**  
**Packaging Products - Paper, Plastic, Compostables for Food and Nutrition Services**

Paper & Plastic Items															
Item No.	Description	Pack Size Per Case	Brand	Qualified Supplier	Mfg Item No.	Usage Per Mo.	Usage Per Yr.	our description	Individual FoodService				Platinum Packaging Group		
									Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)	MFG. Item/IFS#	Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)
1	Apron, Plastic Disposable - 28 x 46, 1 mil	1,000/cs	Goldmax		1532		9 cases		\$ 54.55	Johnson Wilshire		2846-case/ 65527	NO BID		
2	Bag, #6 Sandwich - 4.5 x 4.5	2,000/cs	California Paper Bag		CLB-6SB	35 cases		fry bag	\$ 15.42			6DW	NO BID		
3	Bag, Brown 6#	500/cs	Dura Dubl Life		18406		10 cases		\$ 11.91	Packer		IFS6B	NO BID		
4	Bag, Brown 8#	500/cs	Dura Dubl Life		DUR-51028		10 cases		\$ 13.81	Packer		IFS8B	NO BID		
5	Bag, Foil/Paper, Long, Fresh and Delicious 4 x 2 x 10	1,000/cs	Bagcraft Papercon		300525	10 cases		hot sub wrap	\$ 130.33				NO BID		
6	Bag, Foil Sandwich printed cheeseburger	1000/cs			PPC-300529	5 cases		MS cheeseburger	\$ 79.77				NO BID		
7	Bag, Foil Sandwich printed chicken	1000/cs			PPC-44492	5 cases		MS chicken sandwich	\$ 45.51				NO BID		
8	Bag, Hot Vented - Ovenable - 7.5 x 11.75	5,000/cs	Ekon-O-Pac		HB7511V		8 cases	back-up packing	NO BID				NO BID		
9	Bag, Saddlepack clear 6.5 x 7	2000/cs			HND-SP85MP		5 cases	side fruit or veggies	\$ 8.44	Elkay		DP657/18242	NO BID		
10	Bag, Side Gusset Bag - 8 x 4 x 18, 0.0015 guage	1,000/cs	Elkay		15G-084018	3 cases		poly bag	\$ 58.53				NO BID		
11	Bag, T-shirt 11.5 x 6.5 x 21.5 white	1000/cs			NET-12722-13	5 cases		emergency	\$ 11.36	Packer	785	T-SHIRT/18681	NO BID		
12	Bag, Utility - 18 x 24, 0.60 mil	250/cs	Elkay		BOR1824HD	3 cases		freezer bag	\$ 12.58				NO BID		
13	Bag, Window, Grease Resistant - 5 x 1.5 x 7	500/cs	Bagcraft EcoCraft		300114	30 cases		bagel bag/ cookie catering	\$ 23.17				NO BID		
14	Bouffant Cap, White - 21"	1,000/cs	Goldmax Poly King		20251	1 case		CK	\$ 28.41	Johnson Wilshire	1000	6621/17674	NO BID		
15	Bowl, Black Micro, M4805B - 5oz	500/cs	Anchor Incredi-Bowl		4604802	8 cases		bean/mac & cheese	\$ 46.87				NO BID		
16	Bowl, Black Micro, M5816B - 12oz	500/cs	Anchor Incredi-Bowl		4605817	6 cases		spaghetti	\$ 80.86				NO BID		
17	Box, carryette 9 x5 x3	400/cs			SOU-2730		10 cases	catering	\$ 105.44	SQP	250	3610	NO BID		
18	Box, cutter	12/ cs			CST-E-100	2 cases			\$ 3.92	Pacific Handy		720320	NO BID		
19	Box, Micro Pail, Pagoda, without handle - 1 pint	450/cs	Golden West Paper		GWP-16FP-PMW	8 cases		asian food	\$ 47.56	Fold Pak		16-PAGODA	NO BID		
20	Container, 2 Compartment, Dipping	500/cs	Par-Pak		82612	8 cases		celery	\$ 50.17				NO BID		
21	Container, clamshell	500/cs			PCA-YC181160		5 cases	side salad	\$ 52.89				NO BID		
22	Container, lunch box clear shallow	500/cs			PAR-0210		5 cases	sub sandwich	\$ 70.41				NO BID		
23	Cup, French Fry Munchie - 2.4oz	1,000/cs	Solo		GF24-00645	8 cases		fries	\$ 162.84			IFS#15713	NO BID		
24	Cup, Pleated Paper - 3.5oz	2,500/cs	Genpak		W450F	1 case		water station	\$ 55.64				NO BID		
25	Cup, Portion - 5.5 oz	2000/cs			PCA-Y5550A		5 cases	HS side fruit	\$ 38.82	IFS	2500	62079	NO BID		

26	Film, Wrapmaster Refill Roll - 12" x 2,000'	2/cs	Western Plastic		172	5 cases		plastic wrap	\$ 8.65	K-Pack	1	21121	NO BID		
27	Film, Wrapmaster Refill Roll - 18" x 2,000'	2/cs	Western Plastic		804	1 case		plastic wrap	\$ 13.13	K-Pack	1	21122	NO BID		
28	Foil, Interfolded Sheets - 12 x 10.75	200/bx - 12bx/cs	HFA Medallion		21215		2 cases	foil	\$ 52.27	IFS	3000	IFS721	NO BID		
29	Foil, Wrapmaster Standard - 18 x 500	2/cs	Western Plastic		822	4 case		foil	\$ 36.36	Perrins's	1000'ROLL	IFS615	NO BID		
30	Glove, Rubber Reusable, Yellow - L	144/cs	NetChoice		762049		1 case	dishes	\$ 0.71	Johnson Wilshire	PAIR	94419	NO BID		
31	Glove, Rubber Reusable, Yellow - M	144/cs	NetChoice		762048		1 case	dishes	\$ 0.71	Johnson Wilshire	PAIR	94418	NO BID		
32	Gloves, Nitrile Purple - L	1,000/cs	Handgards ValuGards		304340333	2 cases		food prep	\$ 36.67	Packer		15129	NO BID		
33	Gloves, Nitrile Purple - M	1,000/cs	Handgards ValuGards		304340332	40 cases		food prep	\$ 36.67	Packer		15130	NO BID		
34	Gloves, Nitrile Purple - S	1,000/cs	Handgards ValuGards		304340331	2 cases		food prep	\$ 36.67	Packer		15131	NO BID		
35	Gloves, Nitrile Purple - XL	1,000/cs	Handgards ValuGards		304340334	10 cases		food prep	\$ 37.50	Packer		15132	NO BID		
36	Label, date mark sticker	250/cs			1021130011		10 cases	date marking	\$ 7.95	Daymark		IT112437	NO BID		
37	Lid, Clear - Fits 12 & 16-20oz	500/cs	Anchor Incredi- Bowl		4335800	6 cases		spaghetti bowl lid	\$ 60.88				NO BID		
38	Lid, Clear - Fits 5, 8 & 10oz	500/cs	Anchor Incredi- Bowl		4334810	8 cases		bean/ mac&cheese lid	\$ 41.74				NO BID		
39	Mitt, Oven, Long -17"	1 pair	Arden Pyrotex		2PX27	15 pair			\$ 14.32	Winco	EACH	OMNP- 17/SMWNEP17	NO BID		
40	Napkin, Hynap tall fold	10000/cs			GTS-HS713	2 cases		napkins	\$ 25.68	IFS		IFS-TFN	NO BID		
41	Pan Liner - 16 x 24	1,000/cs	GPQ		PAT-2405161	40 cases			\$ 37.66	Paterson		SG01035/27-1	NO BID		
42	Pan Liner, Hotel Deep - 6"	50/cs	PanSaver		PAN-42002	8 cases		pan saver full hotel pan	\$ 39.52				NO BID		
43	Pan Liner, Hotel Shallow & Medium - 2.5" & 4"	100/cs	PanSaver		PAN-42001	6 cases		pan saver half hotel pan	\$ 65.15				NO BID		
44	Paper, TF6 Interfolded Bakery Tissue - 6 x 10.75	10pkg/cs	Papercon		10006	8 cases		pick up tissue	\$ 52.25	Daisy	1000	BEE6/2051/90	NO BID		
45	Scouring Pad, General Purpose, Green - 6 x 9	6/10/cs			SO96	2 cases		green scrubies	\$ 11.87				NO BID		
46	Thermometer, Wipes Antibacterial	200/cs			1953686	40 cases			\$ 22.22	Diamond	1000	F2449PKT	NO BID		
47	Thermometer, digital waterproof	1 each			70131044013	25 each			\$ 7.66	Winco	1	TMT-DG1	NO BID		
48	Thermometer, oven	1 each			UPD-TH0V-20		60 each		\$ 2.72	Trutemp	1	3506FS/SMW1099	NO BID		
49	Thermometer, pocket dial	1 each			1261365	20 each			\$ 2.60	Taylor	1	3512FS/SMW1101	NO BID		
50	Thermometer, refridge freezer	1 each			5563408	25 each			\$ 2.72	Trutemp	1	3507FS/SMW1100	NO BID		
51	Tray, 1#	1000/cs	Kraftback		GWP-KB100	5 cases		small boat	\$ 30.13	SQP		SQP-7151	NO BID		
52	Tray, 3#	500/cs	Kraftback		GWP-KB300	12 cases		large boat	\$ 24.69	SQP		SQP-7153	NO BID		
53	Tray, Carry Cardboard "My Plate"	500/cs	LA Paperbox		MP963	700 cases		pop up tray	\$ 32.42	SQP	500	7195/39269	NO BID		
54	Wrap, Grease Resistant Natural - 12 x 12	5/1,000/cs	Paterson		22232001212		6 cases	wrap	\$ 67.67	Packer		12X12N	NO BID		
55	Wrap, Honeycomb Blue Check Foil - 10.5 x 14	4/500/cs	Bagcraft		300844	5 cases		foil wrap	\$ 155.00				NO BID		

56	Wrap, Honeycomb Green Check Foil - 10.5 x 14	4/500/cs	Bagcraft		300845	5 cases		foil wrap	\$	148.41				NO BID		
57	Wrap, Honeycomb Red Check Foil - 10.5 x 14	4/500/cs	Bagcraft		300842	5 cases		foil wrap	\$	141.25				NO BID		
58	Wrap, Honeycomb Yellow Foil - 10.5 x 13	4/500/cs	Bagcraft		300828	5 cases		foil wrap	\$	190.06				NO BID		
59	Wrap, Mexiwrap Foil - 10.5 x 14	2,500/cs	Bagcraft		400028	15 cases		foil wrap	\$	123.44				NO BID		
60	Wrapmaster Dispenser, 12"	1 each			WPL-12WMP		4 each	dispenser	NO BID					NO BID		
61	Wrapmaster Dispenser, 18"	1 each			WPL-18WMD		4 each	dispenser	NO BID					NO BID		

**Compostable Items**

Item No.	Description	Pack Size Per Case	Brand	Qualified Supplier	Mfg Item No.	Usage Per Mo.	Usage Per Yr.	our description	Individual FoodService				Platinum Packaging Group			
									Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)	MFG. Item/IFS#	Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)	
62	Bowl & Lid, Salad Clear, Compostable - 18oz	150/cs	Eco Products		EP-SB18	33 cases		side salad	\$	59.13				NO BID		
63	Bowl & Lid, Salad Clear, Compostable - 32oz	150/cs	Eco Products		EP-SB32	59 cases		entrée salad	\$	247.39	World Centric	600	SB-CS-32 BOWL/SBL-CS-32 LID	NO BID		
64	Container, Rectangle, Natural, Sugarcane, Compostable - 32oz - 8.5 x 5.5 x 2	400/cs	Eco Products		EP-NSCRC32	62 cases		catering/HS/MS	\$	86.60				NO BID		
65	Cup, Cold Insert, Clear, GreenStripe, Compostable - 3oz	1,000/cs	Eco Products		EP-CCI3	15 cases		yogurt parfait	\$	19.41	Karat	1000	10202	NO BID		
66	Cup, Cold, Clear, GreenStripe, Compostable - 12oz	1,000/cs	Eco Products		EP-CC12-GS	15 cases		yogurt parfait	\$	127.67	World Centric		CP-CS-12	NO BID		
67	Cup, Cold, Clear, GreenStripe, Compostable - 16oz	1,000/cs	Eco Products		EP-CC16-GS	15 cases		yogurt parfait	\$	147.18	World Centric		CP-CS-16/62506	NO BID		
68	Cup, Cold, Clear, GreenStripe, Compostable - 9oz	1,000/cs	Eco Products		EP-CC9S-GS		6 cases	catering	\$	106.94	World Centric		CP-CS-9Q/45587	NO BID		
69	Cup, Hot Insulated World Art, Compostable - 8oz	800/cs	Eco Products		EP-BNHC8-WD		12 cases	catering	\$	73.09	World Centric	1000	CU-PA-8/62501	NO BID		
70	Cup, Portion, Clear, Compostable - 2oz	2,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		10 cases		taste tests/HS	\$	70.46	World Centric		CP-CS-25/45475	NO BID		
71	Cup, Portion, Sugarcane, Compostable - 2oz			Eco Products, World Centric			6 cases	taste tests	\$	66.04	World Centric	2000	CU-SC-2N	NO BID		
72	Cutlery Roll, Black w/Brown Napkin (K,F,S,N)	100/cs	Eco Products		ESVBKEROLL3		5 cases	catering	\$	81.14				NO BID		
73	Fork, 6in, White, PLA, Compostable	1,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		40 case		MS/HS	\$	42.53	World Centric		FOPS6	NO BID		
74	Fork, 7in, Black, Vine, PLA, Compostable	500/cs	Eco Products		ESVFKBK500	1 case		catering	NO BID					NO BID		
75	Knife, 6in, White, PLA, Compostable	1,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		1 case		MS/HS	\$	42.40	World Centric		KNPS6	NO BID		
76	Knife, 7in, Black, Vine, PLA, Compostable	500/cs	Eco Products		ESVKNBK500		10 cases	catering	NO BID					NO BID		
77	Lid, Clear, RPET - 24/32oz	400/cs	Eco Products		EP-SCRC24LID	25 cases		catering/HS	\$	133.20				NO BID		
78	Lid, Cold, Clear, Flat, GreenStripe, Compostable - 9 & 12-24oz	1,000/cs	Eco Products		EP-FLCC	16 cases		yogurt parfait	\$	56.16	World Centric		CPL-CS-12	NO BID		

79	Lid, Portion, Clear, Compostable - 2-4oz	2,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		10 cases		taste tests/HS	\$ 45.32	World Centric		CPL-CS-2S/45476	NO BID		
80	Lid, Portion, Sugarcane, Compostable - 2oz			Eco Products, World Centric			6 cases	taste tests	\$ 52.66	World Centric	2000	CUL-SC-2N	NO BID		
81	Napkin, Beverage, 2-ply - 9 x 9"	4,000/cs	World Centric		NP-SC-BV		6 cases	catering	\$ 46.14				NO BID		
82	Napkin, Dinner, 2-ply - 15 x 16"	3,000/cs	World Centric		NP-SC-DN		4 cases	catering	\$ 57.35	Packer	3000	18381	NO BID		
83	Plate, Fiber - 10"	800/cs	World Centric		PL-SC-U10		15 cases	catering	\$ 45.88	Perrin's	500	IFS-PL10	NO BID		
84	Plate, Fiber - 7"	1,000/cs	World Centric		PL-SC-U7		10 cases	catering	\$ 40.67	Perrin's	1000	IFS-PL7	NO BID		
85	Spoon, 6in, White, PLA, Compostable	1,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		20 case		MS/HS	\$ 44.64	World Centric		SPPS6	NO BID		
86	Spoon, 7in, Black, Vine, PLA, Compostable	500/cs	Eco Products		ESVSPBK500		10 cases	catering	NO BID				NO BID		
87	Spork, 6" Compostable	1000/cs			WOR-RK-PS-B	300 cases		ES	\$ 43.78	World Centric		RK-PS-B/62500	NO BID		
88	Spork Kit w/Napkin, White, Compostable, Wrapped	1,000/cs		Eco Products, World Centric		220 cases		ES back up	\$ 51.89	World Centric	750	RK-PS-I	NO BID		

**Packaging Products - Trays & Film**

Item No.	Description	Pack Size Per Case	Brand	Qualified Supplier	Mfg Item No.	Usage Per Mo.	Usage Per Yr.	our description	Individual FoodService				Platinum Packaging Group				
									Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)	MFG. Item/IFS#	Proposed Pricing	Brand (if different)	Pack Size Per Case (if different)		
89	Film, Perforated - 5.25SL 500CLF MP 3250 - used for top sealing machine	roll/3,250 ft		Oliver Packaging	60901	15 rolls										PERF-HSPET 6-75h 5.25"X3,250 FT/8.5/LBS Minimum order 10 rolls	
90	Tray, SLT Fiber, 1C - 21oz - 6.5 x 5 x 1.8" - Eco-Serve Tray, Eco-friendly packaging	810/cs		Oliver Packaging	61962	200 cases		entree								Platform Compostable 500 per pack	
91	Tray, Clear Packing 12.0 mil	1,250/cs		Plastic Package	6550	12 cases										No Bid	
92	Tray, SL-33D, Sealable	1,600/cs		Plastic Package	3335-1	5 cases										No Bid	
93	Film, 13" Perforated, Hot Sides	roll/34lbs		Platinum Packaging	5-1300-0808	20 rolls										\$128.00/roll (32/lbs per roll)	10 roll MOQ
94	Film, 14.5" Perforated, Hot Entrees	roll/38lbs		Platinum Packaging	5-1412-0808	20 rolls										\$136.99/roll (28/lbs per roll)	10 roll MOQ
95	Tray, PT102BB, Black	2,250/cs		Platinum Packaging	3010222000	10 cases		tater tots, corn, beans								\$183.91/roll	2,250/case
96	Film, 12.5" 60 gauge, Hot Food	roll		Transilwrap	HSPET-1260	20 rolls										\$91.99/roll 23/lbs per roll	HSPET 10 roll MOQ
97	Film, 15", 60 gauge, Hot/Cold Food	roll/5,100 ft		Transilwrap	HSPET-CL	15 rolls										\$83.00/roll 28 /lbs per roll	HSPET 10 roll MOQ
98	Film, Lidding 3 7/8"	roll/5,100 ft		Transilwrap	RL-3250	2 rolls										No Bid	
99	Film, Cold - 13.5" - used for verticle packaging machine	roll/5,100 ft		VAI, Platinum Packaging		5 rolls										\$2.20/lb 31/lbs per roll	10 roll MOQ mixed with other films